

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott      HD Supply Waterworks      Ferguson Waterworks      Utility Sales Agency

**Ductile Iron Pipe  
Pressure Class 350**

4"	16.44	14.14	15.25	16.96
6"	13.02	11.14	12.08	12.75
8"	17.36	14.50	16.10	16.55
10"	22.34	18.94	20.72	21.65
12"	28.64	24.06	26.57	27.48
16"	46.16	38.68	42.82	44.17
20"	64.07	54.02	59.44	61.69
Mfg. Cat. No.	American PC350	US Pipe TJ	American DI Pipe Class 350-SJ	Clow Pipe PC350 CL 350 (Pricing for Truckload Quantities)

**Line Stop Saddles, for IPSCO Line Stop Machine**

4"	733.35	No Bid	691.09	726.00
6"	933.35	No Bid	879.58	924.00
8"	1300.00	No Bid	1225.13	1287.00
10"	1700.00	No Bid	1602.09	1683.00
12"	1916.70	No Bid	1806.28	1897.50
Mfg. Cat. No.	JCM 440		JCM 440	JCM 440

**Repair Sleeves, Like Clow "duo" F-1208, one sleeve to fit centrifugal and sand cast**

4"	271.75	254.32	256.06	219.52
6"	353.95	331.26	333.52	347.90
8"	409.50	383.27	385.89	588.32
10"	595.20	557.09	560.91	817.08
12"	906.50	848.46	854.27	1018.75
Mfg. Cat. No.	Tyler	Union Tyler 690	Tyler/Union D690	Star Dual Purpose w/ACC (Domestic) MJSDP

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott      HD Supply Waterworks      Ferguson Waterworks      Utility Sales Agency

**CUTTING-IN SLEEVES** mechanical joint, one sleeve to fit both cast iron centrifugal and sand cast, like Clow F-1220

4"	388.95	304.00	366.52	333.60
6"	518.35	387.00	488.46	298.69
8"	671.30	525.00	632.63	368.40
10"	823.55	728.00	776.09	524.87
Mfg.	Tyler	Mueller	Tyler/Union	Star-Domestic
Catalog No.		H840	0691	MJSCO-D

**RESTRAINT FITTINGS** 1 Ft. long

4"	150.00	80.87	84.43	84.48
6"	192.38	80.87	84.43	84.48
8"	252.35	109.93	114.78	114.84
10"	310.60	128.04	133.69	133.76
Mfg.	QWP	Fast Fab	Clearwater Mfg.	US Pipe Domestic
Catalog No.		A-Cplg	Fab	USAP

**RESTRAINT FITTINGS** 18 inches long

4"	161.54	90.97	94.99	95.04
6"	203.17	90.97	94.99	95.04
8"	268.32	128.04	129.73	129.80
10"	344.66	148.26	154.80	154.88
Mfg.	QWP	Fast Fab	Clearwater Mfg.	US Pipe Domestic
Catalog No.		A-Cplg	Fab	USAP

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott      HD Supply Waterworks      Ferguson Waterworks      Utility Sales Agency

**MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT DEVICE** for ductile iron pipe

4"	15.19	15.27	15.61	16.80
6"	18.05	18.15	18.36	19.78
8"	27.42	27.57	28.03	30.19
10"	40.52	40.75	41.49	44.68
12"	59.02	59.36	60.34	65.00
16"	111.30	115.19	109.54	118.55
Mfg.	Romac	Romac	Ford Meter Box	Star-Star Grip Series 3000 L/ACC
Catalog No.	RG-DI	Roma Grip	1400 Series	SGDP-D

**TAPPING SLEEVES** steel body, "O" ring gasket, stainless steel bolts, wide range to fit all classes cast iron pipe, sand cast and centrifugal and C-909 PVC pipe, like Ford FTS-SH

4x4	228.58	342.44	227.38	510.40
6x4	233.54	345.16	232.60	331.10
6x6	268.48	357.78	267.06	361.90
8x4	241.72	335.10	240.45	337.70
16x4	331.07	388.97	329.32	396.00
16x6	350.73	430.53	348.89	440.00
16x8	450.40	535.31	448.04	558.80
8x6	262.17	361.56	260.79	363.00
8x8	349.33	457.82	347.49	465.30
10x4	263.18	337.00	261.80	350.90
10x6	283.09	371.01	281.60	379.50
16X10	524.42	724.44	521.67	741.40
16X12	603.99	819.59	600.82	807.40
20X4	346.68	407.85	344.85	432.30
10X8	351.32	472.94	349.47	474.10
10X10	417.26	613.62	415.06	612.70
12X4	262.72	360.62	261.34	370.70
12X6	282.64	389.91	281.15	404.80
20X6	374.28	454.16	372.31	479.60
20X8	454.18	582.08	451.80	613.80
20X10	538.38	778.02	536.05	790.90
12X8	365.12	499.40	363.20	511.50
12X10	436.68	679.77	434.38	690.80
12X12	555.35	741.17	552.43	748.00
20X12	666.55	842.28	663.05	885.50
Mfg.	Ford	Romac	Ford Meter Box	JCM
Catalog No.	FTS-SH	FTS-420	FTS-SH Series	412/432

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott      HD Supply Waterworks      Ferguson Waterworks      Utility Sales Agency

**CURB BOXES**

**Buffalo type**, screwed shaft, 2-1/2", length 93D like Mueller H-10350

	49.00	45.67	47.34	49.73
--	-------	-------	-------	-------

**Enlarged base**, like Mueller H-10349 for 2-1/2 shaft box

	20.80	19.56	11.47	12.06
--	-------	-------	-------	-------

Mfg. Catalog No.	Bingham & Taylor	Bingham & Taylor 93-D	Tyler/Union 6500 Series	Tyler Domestic 147046 – 93D 144809 – enlarged base
---------------------	------------------	--------------------------	----------------------------	--

**CURB BOX REPAIR LIDS**, like Mueller H-10374

	7.65	7.47	22.95	7.54
--	------	------	-------	------

Mfg. Catalog No.	Tyler	Bingham & Taylor Replce	Tyler/Union 6500 Series	Tyler 144915
---------------------	-------	----------------------------	----------------------------	-----------------

**RESILIENT SEATED GATE VALVES**, "O" ring seal, mechanical joint with accessories

4"	364.00	365.00	349.05	362.66
6"	464.99	467.00	451.64	483.36
8"	739.83	727.00	702.56	750.04
10"	1153.60	1122.00	1092.47	1159.55
12"	1459.73	1412.00	1380.59	1459.05
16"	4893.16	4912.00	4634.70	No Bid
Mfg. Catalog No.	Clow F6100	Mueller A2360	American Flow Control 2500 Series	AVK w/accessories Series 65

**BUTTERFLY VALVES**, Class 125-16, mechanical joint with accessories


16"	5208.90	2957.00	2949.73	No Bid
20"	7872.25	4904.00	4890.62	No Bid
Mfg. Catalog No.	Clow	M & H BFU 150	Kennedy 4500-01	

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott HD Supply Waterworks

Ferguson Waterworks

Utility Sales Agency

**TAPPING VALVES**, LIKE Clow F-6114, mechanical joint outlet with accessories 

4"	459.20	435.00	435.66	454.23
6"	598.67	612.00	604.05	641.93
8"	962.89	807.00	896.23	945.84
10"	1451.96	1357.00	1341.19	1422.02
12"	2193.34	2036.00	2049.70	2137.35
Mfg.	Clow	Mueller	American Flow Control	AVK w/accessories
Catalog No.	F6114	T2360	2500 Series	Series 45

**CUTTING-IN VALVES**, "O" ring seal, mechanical joint, with accessories, like Clow F-6111

4"	513.03	745.00	589.19	521.65
6"	697.83	1013.00	816.50	646.51
8"	1082.05	1571.00	1211.18	986.21
10"	1601.60	No Bid	1813.19	1478.93
12"	2020.98	No Bid	2771.43	1836.71
Mfg.	Clow	Mueller	Kennedy	AVK w/accessories
Catalog No.	F6111	C2360-45	7576	Series 45

**VALVE BOXES**, like Mueller H-10357, size "B", lids marked "WATER"

With No. 6 Round Base	150.55	148.00	172.14	178.60
Less Round base	97.50	96.00	112.60	116.05
Mfg.	Bingham & Taylor	Bingham & Taylor	Tyler/Union	Tyler Domestic
Catalog No.		"B" valve box	6860 Series	145660 #6 base 145936 Top & bottom 145325 Lid

**VALVE BOX TOP SECTIONS ONLY**, less lid, screw type, like Clow F-2455 (16" length)

16" Top Section	37.65	36.99	45.90	48.22
Mfg.	Bingham & Taylor	Bingham & Taylor	Tyler/Union	Tyler Domestic
Catalog No.		#55	6860 Series	144946

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott      HD Supply Waterworks      Ferguson Waterworks      Utility Sales Agency

**VALVE BOX LIDS**      Marked "WATER"

	12.95	14.30	12.18	12.82
Mfg.	Tyler	Bingham & Taylor	Tyler/Union	Tyler Domestic
Catalog No.	145325	Lid	6860 Series	145325

**VALVE BOX ADAPTERS**, like Mueller H-10376, 1" and 2" with special lid if such is required, 3" and 4" without lid to be used with standard valve box lid

1" long	8.80	8.00	8.28	8.70
2" long	13.60	12.30	12.79	13.45
3" long	22.45	21.70	21.12	22.19
4" long	32.90	27.00	30.98	32.55
Mfg.	Tyler	Bingham & Taylor	Tyler/Union	Tyler Domestic
Catalog No.		Risers	5336 Series	533641, 533689, 533696, 533702

**VALVE BOX EXTENSION SECTION**, Like Clow F-2475

14" long	29.62	29.54	43.03	45.21
18" long	36.95	36.84	52.35	55.01
Mfg.	Bingham & Taylor	Bingham & Taylor	Tyler/Union	Tyler Domestic
Catalog No.	#57/#58	#57/#58	1451 Series	145141/145158

**FIRE HYDRANTS**

10 (More or Less) Fire Hydrants – 4' Bury	1974.25	1975.00	No Bid	No Bid
40 (More or Less) Fire Hydrants – 5' Bury	2054.50	2059.00	No Bid	No Bid
10 (More or Less) Fire Hydrants – 6' Bury	2135.25	2138.00	No Bid	No Bid
Traffic Repair Kit (Bolts, Nuts, Flanges, Gaskets, Stem Couplings, Pins, etc.)	171.35	145.00	No Bid	No Bid
Mfg.	Clow	Mueller	No Bid	No Bid
Catalog No.	Eddy	A423		

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott      HD Supply Waterworks      Ferguson Waterworks      Utility Sales Agency

**SERVICE CLAMPS**, Double strap, cast iron, C-900 plastic and asbestos cement – all classes, tapped corporation, w/stainless steel bolts, like Ford FS202

¾"X				
4"	27.65	27.18	43.58	36.30
6"	29.70	29.19	45.37	40.70
8"	37.30	36.67	56.39	52.80
10"	43.77	43.03	68.63	59.40
12"	50.75	49.89	79.57	70.40
1" X				
4"	27.65	27.18	43.58	36.30
6"	29.70	29.19	45.37	40.70
8"	37.30	36.67	56.39	52.80
10"	43.77	43.03	68.63	59.40
12"	50.75	49.89	79.57	70.40
1-1/2"X				
4"	30.20	29.69	48.78	42.90
6"	33.46	32.90	50.08	46.20
8"	41.46	40.76	60.81	58.30
10"	50.06	49.21	73.13	68.20
12"	57.99	57.01	81.62	77.00
2" x				
4"	30.20	29.69	48.78	42.90
6"	33.46	32.90	50.08	46.20
8"	41.46	40.76	60.81	58.30
10"	50.06	49.21	73.13	68.20
12"	57.99	57.01	81.62	77.00
Mfg. Catalog No.	Romac 2025	Romac 2025	Ford Meter Box FSD202 Series	JCM 404

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott    HD Supply Waterworks    Ferguson Waterworks    Utility Sales Agency

**REPAIR CLAMPS**, cast iron and asbestos cement, like Ford F1-SH

7-1/2" X				
4"	47.47	47.64	47.22	7" X
6"	52.27	54.56	51.98	56.10
8"	60.07	62.44	61.72	66.00
10"	74.79	76.43	74.39	77.00
12"	83.33	88.08	87.84	101.20
				114.40
10" X				
4"	64.64	66.02	64.30	N/B
6"	70.66	74.44	70.28	N/B
8"	79.67	83.37	82.86	N/B
10"	101.14	103.75	100.60	N/B
12"	110.40	117.86	115.36	N/B
12" X				
4"	76.82	81.37	76.41	90.20
6"	84.43	89.11	83.98	106.70
8"	97.04	101.82	99.73	124.30
10"	118.63	120.92	118.01	159.50
12"	134.13	143.08	139.46	182.60
15" X				
4"	85.93	95.40	85.47	107.80
6"	98.02	105.79	97.50	122.10
8"	112.10	122.87	115.23	141.90
10"	137.53	150.96	136.80	182.60
12"	153.06	177.18	155.68	207.90
20" X				18" X
4"	127.94	127.95	127.26	132.00
6"	141.28	148.02	140.54	159.50
8"	157.60	166.59	161.82	182.60
10"	183.77	201.76	182.80	256.30
12"	212.08	234.25	224.98	287.10
24" X				
4"	154.08	160.48	153.27	177.10
6"	169.46	181.31	168.57	217.80
8"	187.80	200.62	234.96	233.20
10"	223.30	229.62	222.13	333.40
12"	259.15	275.73	273.08	379.50



CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

	E.J. Prescott	HD Supply Waterworks	Ferguson Waterworks	Utility Sales Agency
30" X				
4"	193.18	193.03	192.16	231.00
6"	208.36	216.77	207.26	262.90
8"	246.70	236.89	245.95	291.50
10"	268.42	306.25	267.01	397.10
12"	308.39	354.34	321.88	448.80
Mfg.	Ford	Romac	Ford Meter Box	JCM
Catalog No.	F1SH	CL1	F1-SH Series	101

**REPAIR CLAMPS**, cast iron and asbestos cement, like Ford F2-SH

7-1/2" X				7" X
6"	90.28	88.77	94.20	95.70
8"	99.38	97.71	107.88	107.80
10"	103.22	101.49	82.90	N/B
12"	110.61	108.75	126.02	N/B
10" X				
6"	118.55	116.56	120.34	N/B
8"	128.48	126.32	138.93	N/B
10"	147.00	158.83	109.82	N/B
12"	154.36	151.77	156.76	N/B
12" X				
6"	141.67	139.30	145.39	145.20
8"	153.22	150.65	167.54	161.70
10"	174.06	196.47	133.42	217.80
12"	182.13	211.00	181.17	231.00
15" X				
6"	180.63	179.75	179.68	182.60
8"	201.83	198.45	208.13	205.70
10"	214.18	216.66	152.26	N/B
12"	229.27	225.55	228.07	N/B
20" X				18" X
6"	242.04	239.66	240.77	239.80
8"	263.57	259.16	283.01	267.30
10"	286.38	287.91	210.96	328.90
12"	306.59	301.45	310.05	345.40

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

	E.J. Prescott	HD Supply Waterworks	Ferguson Waterworks	Utility Sales Agency
24" X				
6"	288.28	299.16	286.77	287.10
8"	304.27	299.16	370.10	312.40
10"	360.82	359.86	257.79	438.90
12"	382.69	376.27	397.73	480.70
30" X				
6"	364.77	358.65	363.30	376.20
8"	392.24	397.66	390.18	426.80
10"	435.26	431.84	306.77	557.70
12"	458.77	451.08	463.53	606.10
Mfg. Catalog No.	Ford F2-SH	Romac CL2	Ford Meter Box F2-SH Series	JCM 102
7.5" X				
16"	204.00	200.58	N/B	N/B
20"	228.02	224.20	N/B	N/B
12" X				
16"	231.46	275.59	230.25	332.20
20"	267.61	301.49	266.20	368.50
15" X				18" X
16"	273.95	347.36	272.51	528.00
20"	300.62	399.77	299.04	599.50
20" X				24" X
16"	369.97	469.17	368.03	739.20
20"	406.07	514.92	403.93	972.40
30" x				
16"	558.94	763.22	556.01	969.10
20"	613.52	858.90	610.30	1081.30
Mfg. Catalog No.	Ford F2-SH	Romac CL3	Ford Meter Box F2-SH Series	JCM 102

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott      HD Supply Waterworks      Ferguson Waterworks      Utility Sales Agency

**REPAIR CLAMPS**, cast iron, nominal size 2", O>D. 2.35-2.63 with stainless bolts & nuts, like Ford F1-SH

7-1/2"	43.45	46.76	43.21	44.00
12"	65.27	79.86	64.92	73.70
Mfg. Catalog No.	Ford F1-SH	Romac CL1	Ford Meter Box F1-SH Series	JCM 101

**REPAIR CLAMPS**, cast iron and asbestos-cement, one clamp, tapped 3/4" and 1" corporation stop thread, 4" through 8", like Ford F1-SH, 10" through 12", like Ford F2-SH with stainless steel bolts & nuts

4 x 7-1/2"				4 x 7"
3/4"	60.88	65.70	60.56	86.90
1"	60.88	65.70	60.56	86.90
1-1/2"	68.45	75.93	68.09	108.90
2"	74.46	82.29	74.07	119.90
4 x 12"				
3/4"	89.68	92.01	89.21	121.00
1"	89.68	92.01	89.21	121.00
1-1/2"	95.32	109.66	94.81	143.00
2"	101.3	116.02	100.74	154.00
6 x 7-1/2"				6 x 7"
3/4"	69.32	72.62	68.95	96.80
1"	69.32	72.62	68.95	96.80
1-1/2"	74.93	82.86	74.54	118.80
2"	80.95	89.21	80.52	129.80
6 x 12"				
3/4"	100.06	107.17	99.53	137.50
1"	100.06	107.17	99.53	137.50
1-1/2"	105.69	117.41	105.14	159.50
2"	111.71	123.76	111.12	170.50
8 x 7-1/2"				8 x 7"
3/4"	75.94	80.49	81.28	107.80
1"	75.94	80.49	81.28	107.80
1-1/2"	81.58	123.22	87.22	129.80
2"	87.58	130.23	93.57	140.80

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

	E.J. Prescott	HD Supply Waterworks	Ferguson Waterworks	Utility Sales Agency
8 x 12"				
¾"	110.76	132.27	111.86	155.10
1"	110.76	132.27	111.86	155.10
1-1/2"	116.40	143.58	117.46	177.10
2"	122.42	150.58	123.44	188.10
10 x 7-1/2"				
¾"	126.92	132.79	126.26	N/B
1"	126.92	132.79	126.26	N/B
1-1/2"	140.72	207.86	139.97	N/B
2"	147.09	215.52	146.32	N/B
10 x 12"				
¾"	174.33	258.91	173.41	248.60
1"	174.33	258.91	173.41	248.60
1-1/2"	179.96	271.27	179.01	270.60
2"	185.97	278.94	184.99	281.60
12 x 7-1/2"				
¾"	140.29	157.73	139.54	N/B
1"	140.29	157.73	139.54	N/B
1-1/2"	146.26	170.09	145.49	N/B
2"	152.64	177.75	151.84	N/B
12 x 12"				
¾"	181.52	285.53	180.57	261.80
1"	181.52	285.53	180.57	261.80
1-1/2"	187.15	297.90	186.17	283.80
2"	193.15	305.56	192.14	294.80
Mfg.	Ford	Romac	Ford Meter Box	JCM
Catalog No.	F1 & F2-SH	CL2	F1-SH Series	103 & 104

**BRASS ELLS, 90 degree, lead-free**

½"	5.87	N/B	5.17	N/B
¾"	7.85	N/B	6.91	N/B
1"	12.75	N/B	11.23	N/B
1-1/2"	25.50	N/B	22.48	N/B
2"	41.15	N/B	36.28	N/B
Mfg.	Merit Brass		Merit Brass	
Catalog No.	LF-90 degree		BRLF9 Series	

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott    HD Supply Waterworks    Ferguson Waterworks    Utility Sales Agency

**CORPORATION STOPS**, ball type for copper, flare outlet, lead free, with coupling nut, like Ford FB600-NL

3/4"	33.55	33.70	33.54	33.24
1"	43.07	43.13	43.06	42.66
1-1/2"	101.92	102.13	101.91	101.01
2"	178.03	178.40	178.03	176.44
Mfg.	Ford	AY McDonald	Ford Meter Box	Cambridge Brass NL
Catalog No.	FB600-NL	74701B	FB-600-NL Series	301NL

**CORPORATION STOPS**, ball type for copper, quick outlet, lead free, like Ford FB1000-Q-NL

3/4"	34.58	34.63	34.57	34.26
1"	45.48	45.55	45.47	45.07
1-1/2"	101.92	102.13	101.91	101.00
2"	168.55	168.92	168.55	167.07
Mfg.	Ford	AY McDonald	Ford Meter Box	Cambridge Brass NL
Catalog No.	FB1000-Q-NL	74701BQ	FB-1000-Q-NL Series	301NL

**CURB STOPS**, ball type, inlet copper flare, outlet copper flare, like Ford B22-NL

3/4"	47.96	48.06	47.95	47.54
1"	66.25	66.37	66.25	65.64
1-1/2"	160.92	161.25	160.91	159.48
2"	263.39	263.95	263.39	261.06
Mfg.	Ford	AY McDonald	Ford Meter Box	Cambridge Brass NL
Catalog No.	B22-NL	76100	B22-NL Series	202NL

**CURB STOPS**, ball type, inlet female iron pipe, outlet female iron pipe, like Ford B11-NL

3/4"	36.79	36.86	36.78	36.46
1"	57.17	57.27	57.17	56.66
1-1/2"	117.06	117.30	117.05	116.01
2"	171.20	171.55	171.20	169.67
Mfg.	Ford	AY McDonald	Ford Meter Box	Cambridge Brass NL
Catalog No.	B11-NL	76101	B11-NL Series	202NL

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott HD Supply Waterworks

Ferguson Waterworks

Utility Sales Agency

**CURB STOPS**, ball type, inlet copper flare, outlet female iron pipe, like Ford B21-NL

3/4"	43.49	43.57	43.48	43.09
1"	61.40	61.54	61.40	60.86
1-1/2"	139.02	139.31	139.01	137.78
2"	204.12	204.55	204.11	202.31
Mfg.	Ford	AY McDonald	Ford Meter Box	Cambridge Brass NL
Catalog No.	B21-NL	76102	B21-NL Series	202NL

**CURB STOPS**, ball type, inlet copper quick, outlet copper quick, like Ford B44-Q-NL

3/4"	47.33	47.43	47.32	46.92
1"	71.16	71.30	71.16	70.57
1-1/2"	170.28	170.63	170.28	168.77
2"	239.39	239.88	239.39	237.25
Mfg.	Ford	AY McDonald	Ford Meter Box	Cambridge Brass NL
Catalog No.	B44-Q-NL	76100Q	B44-Q-NL Series	202NL

**CURB STOPS**, ball type, inlet copper quick, outlet female iron pipe, like Ford B41-Q-NL

3/4"	41.56	41.65	41.56	41.21
1"	63.82	63.96	63.82	63.26
1-1/2"	139.75	139.31	139.01	137.78
2"	193.29	193.70	193.28	191.57
Mfg.	Ford	AY McDonald	Ford Meter Box	Cambridge Brass NL
Catalog No.	B41-Q-NL	76102Q	B41-Q-NL Series	202NL

**COUPLINGS**, male threads x copper quick, like Ford C84-Q-NL

3/4"	10.77	10.74	10.71	10.63
1"	12.76	12.71	12.69	12.58
1-1/2"	34.95	34.83	34.76	34.46
2"	50.93	50.75	50.65	50.20
Mfg.	Ford	AY McDonald	Ford Meter Box	Cambridge Brass NL
Catalog No.	C84-Q-NL	74753Q	C84-Q-NL Series	117NL

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott    HD Supply Waterworks    Ferguson Waterworks    Utility Sales Agency

**COUPLINGS**, female threads x copper quick, like Ford C14-Q-NL

3/4"	11.33	11.28	11.26	11.16
1"	15.38	15.31	15.29	15.15
1-1/2"	44.71	44.56	44.47	44.08
2"	53.22	53.05	52.94	52.47
Mfg.	Ford	AY McDonald	Ford Meter Box	Cambridge Brass NL
Catalog No.	C14-Q-NL	74754Q	C14-Q-NL Series	117NL

**COUPLINGS**, copper quick x copper quick, like Ford C44-Q-NL

3/4"	13.12	13.07	13.04	12.94
1"	15.01	14.96	14.93	14.79
1-1/2"	50.21	50.04	49.94	49.50
2"	67.79	67.57	67.43	66.84
Mfg.	Ford	AY McDonald	Ford Meter Box	Cambridge Brass NL
Catalog No.	C44-Q-NL	74758Q	C44-Q-NL Series	119NL

**WIDE RANGE COUPLINGS**, like Ford FC2W-SH w/stainless steel bolts and nuts

4"	110.76	109.08	110.17	160.60
6"	141.97	149.02	141.22	217.80
8"	159.80	177.29	158.96	266.20
10"	223.55	229.05	222.37	332.20
12"	258.28	267.10	256.92	387.20
Mfg.	Ford	Romac	Ford Meter Box	JCM
Catalog No.	FC2W-SH	XR501	FC2W-SH Series	241SS

**WIDE RANGE COUPLINGS**, two bolt coupling, like Romac Macro

4"	140.02	139.00	130.77	N/B
6"	184.79	183.45	173.18	N/B
8"	209.26	207.70	195.52	N/B
10"	289.41	287.00	251.53	N/B
12"	381.02	376.00	296.90	N/B
Mfg.	Romac	Romac	Krausz (Hymax)	N/B
Catalog No.	Macro	Macro HP	860 Series	N/B

CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott      HD Supply Waterworks      Ferguson Waterworks      Utility Sales Agency

**RESTRAINED JOINT WIDE RANGE COUPLINGS**, two bolt coupling, like Romac Alpha

4"	175.26	174.00	N/B	N/B
6"	227.37	227.00	N/B	N/B
8"	258.16	257.50	N/B	N/B
10"	350.64	350.00	N/B	N/B
12"	393.16	392.00	N/B	N/B
Mfg.	Romac	Romac	N/B	N/B
Catalog No.	ALPHA	ALPHA		

**METER YOKES**, like Ford #501, #503, #504 w/ (1) iron yoke ell and nut and (1) angle yoke locking key valve. (Brass to be no lead)

5/8" like #501	33.86	33.52	33.75	33.38
3/4" like #503	35.34	34.99	35.25	34.85
1" like #504	57.43	56.89	57.28	56.66
Mfg.	Ford	AY McDonald	Ford Meter Box	Cambridge Brass NL
Catalog No.			Y50-AV90-L91 Series	460 Yoke Bar, 150 NL – Ell Coupling 210NL – Angle Valve

**METER EXPANSION CONNECTIONS**, like Ford EC-1-NL

5/8"	12.71	12.78	12.63	12.54
3/4"	14.40	14.49	14.32	14.21
1"	24.19	24.33	24.06	23.87
Mfg.	Ford	AY McDonald	Ford Meter Box	Cambridge Brass NL
Catalog No.	EC-NL		EC-NL Series	430NL

**METER BOXES**, polyethylene, like Fratco

20" I.D., 30" long	36.50	36.35	61.16	41.04 (pricing good for orders of 100 meter parts or more)
Mfg.	Old Castle	ADS	Old Castle Precast (Mid States Plastic)	Fratco
Catalog No.		2030	0020 Series	40203000



CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
DEPARTMENT OF UTILITIES

E.J. Prescott      HD Supply Waterworks      Ferguson Waterworks      Utility Sales Agency

**METER BOX EXTENSION**, to fit Midstates plastic boxes

3"	22.58	29.00	28.07	N/B
4"	24.28	30.00	28.56	N/B
6"	25.55	31.00	29.52	N/B
8"	27.22	34.00	31.87	N/B
Mfg.	Old Castle	Carson	Old Castle Precast (Mid States Plastic)	N/B
Catalog No.			0020 Series	

**METER BOX COVERS**, with lids

4" Depth, like Ford C3T	55.45	55.36	64.07	53.74
4" Depth, Extra Heavy, Like Ford C3HT	89.05	87.61	131.50	77.68
Mfg.	Bingham & Taylor	Bingham & Taylor	Ford Meter Box	Vestal – Domestic
Catalog No.		#180	C3-T Series	32-226B 32-275

**METER BOX LIDS**

Extra Heavy, Like Ford C3LHT	28.98	28.65	38.51	27.86
Standard Weight, like Ford C3LT	24.64	24.20	24.72	23.96
Mfg.	Bingham & Taylor	Bingham & Taylor	Ford Meter Box	Vestal - Domestic
Catalog No.		#180	C3L-T Series	HD Lid VESCVR