

**CITY OF LIMA OHIO  
 BID TABULATION FOR 2021 PUBLIC WORKS MATERIALS**

		<b>Brew Pro 9483 Reading Road Cincinnati, Ohio 45215</b>	<b>Ernst Concrete Inc. 377 S. Central Ave. Lima, OH 45804</b>	<b>Fidelity Builders Supply Inc. 344 E. North Street Lima, OH 45801</b>	<b>Hei-Way LLC 290 North Pike Road Sarver, PA 16055</b>	<b>National Lime &amp; Stone Co. 1314 Findlay Rd. Lima, OH 45801</b>	<b>Unique Paving Materials Corp. 3993 E 93rd Street Cleveland, OH 44105</b>
<b>Quantity:</b>	<b>Name of Item:</b>						
<b>ODOT</b>	<b>ITEM #s</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2: \$11.25 304 02: \$11.25 411 02: \$11.25 57: \$12.75 8: \$16.00 9's Ice Grit: \$17.00 703 02: \$33.00 703 03: \$35.00 703 05: \$12.75 703 10: \$12.75 D Rip Rap: \$22.00 B, C Rip Rap: \$25.00	No Bid
200 tons	Bituminous Cold Mix	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$118.00/ton	No Bid	<u>UPM® Permanent Pavement                      Repair Material</u> \$104.50/ton <i>F.O.B. Shelly Co. Lima, OH</i>
10,000 tons	Crushed Limestone	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
500 cubic yards	Portland Cement Concrete	No Bid	\$137.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
300 bags	Portland Cement	No Bid	No Bid	94 lb bag \$23.75 per bag	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Main Broom for Self-Propelled Sweepers	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

**CITY OF LIMA OHIO  
 BID TABULATION FOR 2021 PUBLIC WORKS MATERIALS**

		<b>Brew Pro 9483 Reading Road Cincinnati, Ohio 45215</b>	<b>Ernst Concrete Inc. 377 S. Central Ave. Lima, OH 45804</b>	<b>Fidelity Builders Supply Inc. 344 E. North Street Lima, OH 45801</b>	<b>Hei-Way LLC 290 North Pike Road Sarver, PA 16055</b>	<b>National Lime &amp; Stone Co. 1314 Findlay Rd. Lima, OH 45801</b>	<b>Unique Paving Materials Corp. 3993 E 93rd Street Cleveland, OH 44105</b>
<b>Quantity:</b>	<b>Name of Item:</b>						
30	Gutter Brooms for Self-Propelled Sweepers	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15 M	Bricks	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.25 each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
200 tons	Fine Aggregate	No Bid	No Bid	\$59.00 per ton	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
100	CCA Type C Posts	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
200 yards	Control Denisty Fill	No Bid	\$113.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
100 tons	Shot Rock		No Bid	No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
20,000 lbs.	Crack Sealing Materials	Plyolastic Crack Filler \$50.00/5 gal pail delivered to City of Lima	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<u>Kold Flo® Pourable Crack Filler</u> <u>(Emulsion Crack Filler)</u> \$54.75/5 gal pail <i>delivered to City of Lima</i>
	<b>Terms of Payment:</b>	Net 30 Days	Net 30 Days	Net 10 Days	Net 30 Days	Net 30 Days	Net 30 Days

**CITY OF LIMA OHIO  
BID TABULATION FOR 2021 PUBLIC WORKS MATERIALS**

		Brew Pro 9483 Reading Road Cincinnati, Ohio 45215	Ernst Concrete Inc. 377 S. Central Ave. Lima, OH 45804	Fidelity Builders Supply Inc. 344 E. North Street Lima, OH 45801	Hei-Way LLC 290 North Pike Road Sarver, PA 16055	National Lime & Stone Co. 1314 Findlay Rd. Lima, OH 45801	Unique Paving Materials Corp. 3993 E 93rd Street Cleveland, OH 44105
Quantity:	Name of Item:						
	<b>Shipping Rate &amp; F.O.B Information:</b>	MINIMUM ORDER 1 PALLET, 36-5GAL PAILS PER PALLET. PRICE IS DELIVERED TO CITY OF LIMA	<u>Less than 4 yrds</u> \$75.00 <u>Truck hold after 60 min</u> \$60.00/hr. <i>Delivery charge waived if over 4 yards</i>	\$20.00 per Delivery	PRICE QUOTED INCLUDES DELIVERY WITH A MINIMUM 23 TON ORDER		<u>UPM® Permanent Pavement Repair Material</u> <i>F.O.B Shelly Co. Lima, OH</i>  <u>Kold Flo® Pourable Crack Filler (Emulsion Crack Filler)</u> Minimum Order 1 Pallet, 36-5gal pail per pallet
	<b>Approximate delivery time after receipt of order:</b>	3-5 Days	4 hours		2 Days		1-2 Days
	<b>Additional Charges:</b>	N/A	<u>Winter Charge (Nov. 1-March 31)</u> \$4.00/yard <u>Calcium Chloride per 1%</u> \$3.0/yard <u>Fiber Mesh</u> \$8.00/yard	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A